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This paper aims to review how different approaches to social inquiry (e.g. positivist,
postpositivist, interpretive, postmodernist and critical theory) have been used in strat-
egy research and how these main paradigms engage with strategy. In a fragmented do-
main, debates typically match paradigms to schools of thought and use the paradigm
concept, sometimes even promiscuously, to examine the underlying premises of dif-
ferent theories. Thus, scholars tend to overlook the debate on philosophical meta-
theoretical assumptions (ontological, epistemological and methodological) and prefer
onto-epistemological approaches that are considered to be ‘normal science’, which un-
derestimate the contributions of certain less traditional streams of research. This re-
view offers a fresh view of the philosophical foundations of the strategic literature by
combining author co-citation and content analysis of a sample of academic sources and
analyses both the meta-theoretical assumptions and the basic paradigmatic assump-
tions for central constructs that strategy researchers attach to their frameworks (e.g.
strategy, environment, firm and strategist). This endeavour enables scholars who work
in a multidisciplinary field to gain a better understanding of the philosophical beliefs,
principles and conventions held by different research communities and theoretical ap-
proaches. Exposing the underlying assumptions, as is done in this study, is a key step
in theory development. Hence, this review can help researchers, young scholars and
doctoral students navigate a confusing research landscape, problematize the existing
literature and set new research questions.

Introduction

Originating in the early 1960s, strategic manage-
ment was widely accepted as a scientific field by
the 1980s, when economists controlled the arena.
Although the field has witnessed dramatic and suc-
cessful progress since then (Hitt et al. 2004; Leiblein
and Reuer 2020), the continuous alternation of dom-
inant schools of thought and refocusing of the field
have led to polarization and fragmentation (Durand
et al. 2017; Sanchez and Heene 1997; Stonehouse
and Snowdon 2007), which has shaped the accumu-
lation of knowledge (Camerer 1985; Carlson and
Hatfield 2004; Summer et al. 1990). To study the
evolution of the field, scholars have proposed clas-

sifications of schools or models of strategy (Chaffee
1985; French 2009; Knights and Morgan 1991;
Martinet 1997; Mintzberg and Lampel 1999;
Rouleau and Seguin 1995; Whittington 1993).
Scholars have also introduced concepts from the
philosophy and sociology of science, including
dominant designs (Herrmann 2005), the Lakatosian
idea of a research programme (Farjoun 2002; Teece
1990) and especially the Kuhnian paradigm concept
(Ansoff 1987; Camerer 1985; Combe 1999; Dagnino
2016; Prahalad and Hamel 1994; Rasche 2008;
Sanchez and Heene 1997; Schendel 1994).

Following Kuhn’s (1970) conceptualization of
paradigms, strategic management has been rec-
ognized as a multiparadigmatic body of research.
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As Calori (1998, p. 284) suggests, one ‘unifying
paradigm’ does not exist, whereas the combination
of interdisciplinary roots and theoretical incom-
mensurability has made it doubtful that a single
dominant or unifying ‘paradigm will ever govern the
field’ during a period of normal science (Leiblein
and Reuer 2020; Schendel 1994, p. 2). Although
many strategy scholars consider the paradigmatic
discussion to be overly ambitious (Volberda 2004)
or do not see Kuhn’s (1970) revolution-driven idea
as the best framework for understanding the sci-
entific progress of the strategy field (Durand et al.
2017; Rumelt et al. 1994), Kuhn’s (1970) model
remains highly influential in management research
(Shepherd and Challenger 2013). Indeed, not only
is the paradigm concept popular in strategy de-
bates (Ansoff 1987; Camerer 1985; Combe 1999;
Dagnino 2016; Prahalad and Hamel 1994; Rasche
2008; Sanchez and Heene 1997; Schendel 1994),
but the presence of multiple paradigms in strategy
research has also guided the process of knowledge
accumulation (Carlson and Hatfield 2004).

However, most previous paradigmatic discussions
in the strategy field typically match paradigms to
theories or schools of thought while understand-
ing the paradigm concept in the Kuhnian sense.
Moreover, the paradigmatic debates among strategic
management scholars are quite scattered, although
such debates in organization science have been in-
tense and have led to controversies that took the
form of paradigm wars between the late 1980s and
mid-1990s (Cannella and Paetzold 1994; Donald-
son 1999; Jackson and Carter 1993; Pfeffer 1993;
Willmott 1993). Earlier studies tend to overlook the
debate on philosophical meta-theoretical assump-
tions (ontological, epistemological and methodolog-
ical) and undervalue less traditional streams of re-
search. These circumstances have led to a state of
‘resounding silence’ (Whipp 1999, p. 19) and call
for an ‘explicit philosophical debate in strategy lit-
erature’ (Mir and Watson 2001, p. 1170), particularly
more post-Kuhnian paradigmatic explorations, which
accept ‘multiparadigmaticism’ (McKelvey 1997) in
the preparadigmatic social fields (Burrell and Mor-
gan 1979; Cunliffe 2011; Deetz 1996; Gioia and Pitre
1990; Morgan and Smircich 1980).

Following Rasche’s (2008, p. 35) call for an ap-
proach that combines the ideas of Kuhn (1970)
and Burrell and Morgan’s (1979) notion of meta-
paradigms, this paper scrutinizes the strategy re-
search by identifying its main scholarly communities
and deconstructing the meta-theoretical premises and

underlying assumptions embedded in the most pop-
ular theories in the field. Although taxonomies have
evolved to reflect the evolution of social paradigms,
the social sciences have typically been organized
around contending paradigms such as positivist,
postpositivist, interpretive, postmodernist and criti-
cal theory (Guba and Lincoln 1994; Lincoln et al.
2018). This paper aims not to discuss these socio-
logical paradigms deeply, which many experts have
already done (Cunliffe 2011; Deetz 1996; Gephart
2004; Hassard and Cox 2013), but rather to re-
view how different approaches to social enquiry have
been used in strategy research and how the main
paradigms engage with strategy.

To achieve its goal, the paper first builds a
paradigmatic interpretation of the strategy field by
combining author co-citation and content analysis of
a sample of academic sources. Next, after isolating
scientific communities, the study intends to isolate
theories, discuss their underlying assumptions and
illuminate four onto-epistemological spaces concep-
tualized as meta-paradigms. Thus, the contribution of
this review to the strategic management literature is
twofold. First, it offers a fresh view of the philosoph-
ical foundations of the strategic literature by recog-
nizing and describing the four main meta-paradigms
in strategic management. Second, it scrutinizes the
basic model problems and meta-theoretical assump-
tions (ontological, epistemological and methodolog-
ical) of the main strategy meta-paradigms. This
endeavour enables scholars who work in a multi-
disciplinary field to gain a better understanding of
the philosophical beliefs, principles and conven-
tions held by different research communities and
theoretical approaches. Exposing the underlying
assumptions, as is done in this study, is a key step in
theory development (Alvesson and Sandberg 2011;
Makadok et al. 2018). Hence, this review can help re-
searchers, young scholars and doctoral students nav-
igate a confusing research landscape, problematize
the existing literature and set new research questions.

The paradigm concept in
organizational inquiry

In organizational inquiry, ‘the term paradigm has
become promiscuous’ (Johnson and Duberley 2000,
p. 88) and ‘holds different meanings to different re-
searchers’ (Carlson and Hatfield 2004, p. 274). These
views are not surprising, particularly considering
both the lack of clarity of Kuhn’s paradigm concept
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(McKelvey 1999; Pinder and Moore 1980) and the
fact that Kuhn himself uses the term ‘paradigm’ in
over 20 senses (Masterman 1970; McKelvey 1999;
Morgan 1980). Morgan (1980, pp. 606–607) groups
these uses into three broad categories: first, ‘as a
complete view of reality’; second, ‘as relating to the
concrete use of specific kinds of tools and text for the
process of scientific puzzle solving’; and third, ‘as
relating to the social organization of science in terms
of schools of thought connected with particular kinds
of scientific achievements’. Similarly, Carlson and
Hatfield (2004) conclude that the term ‘paradigm’ in
strategy research alternatively refers to the specific
phenomena that must be studied, the specific theory
or hypothesis being used to explain the relevant
findings, and the methodological approach used to
conduct the research.

Organizational and strategy scientists typically
refer to the concept of paradigm and associate it with
the idea of a school of thought or even theory. Davis
(2010) concludes that the main theories from the
1970s (a handful of paradigms) still dominate the re-
search in organizational theory, whereas Donaldson
(1995, p. 4) considers these alternative organiza-
tional theories to be antithetic and incommensurable
‘paradigms in the Kuhnian sense’, which have their
own axioms and theoretical ideas, language and set
of supporters that form a scholarly community. A
similar position is taken by Aldrich (1988) in his
participation in the paradigmatic debate.

Most previous paradigmatic discussions in the
strategy field have also matched paradigms to the-
ories or research streams (Dagnino 2016; Furrer
et al. 2008; Gavetti and Levinthal 2004; MacIn-
tosh and MacLean 1999; McKiernan 1996; Teece
et al. 1997). Following a ‘balanced pluralism’ view
– such as that advocated by Foss (1996a, p. 4) –
paradigms are understood as different ‘theoretical
alternatives’ that use models drawing on different
core assumptions to examine the same phenomenon.
While using paradigms in the ‘Kuhnian’ sense,
strategy researchers typically examine the core
premises included in the model problems of different
theories. These scholars focus mainly on the discus-
sion of incommensurability, alternately calling for
eclecticism and pluralism (Foss 1996a; Mahoney
1993; Schoemaker 1993; Thomas and Pruett 1993),
integration (Combe 1999; Durand et al. 2017)
and cross-fertilization (Mahoney 1993; McKier-
nan 1997; Montgomery 1988; Seth and Thomas
1994). Moreover, like organizational inquiry, strat-
egy research has traditionally been dominated by

the positivist (functionalist–managerialist) approach
(McKelvey 1997, 2003), which sees strategy as
rational planning and control (formulated and im-
plemented by functional managers). Consequently,
previous studies tend to overlook the debate on
philosophical meta-theoretical assumptions (onto-
logical, epistemological and methodological) when
addressing the paradigmatic discussion and typically
prefer approaches that are considered to be ‘normal
science’, which underestimate the contributions of
certain less traditional, that is nonpositivist, streams
of research (Carter et al. 2010; Pettigrew et al. 2002).

The concept of paradigms remains influential
in management research (Shepherd and Challenger
2013), whereas the paradigmatic discussion is still
a powerful tool (Hassard 2016) to understand the
philosophical foundations of the strategy field. It
identifies the lack of a single disciplinary matrix
(Kuhn 1970) and emphasizes the roots of incommen-
surability. Although Kuhn’s (1970) model may be
better suited to natural sciences and has been harshly
criticized (McKelvey 1999), later paradigmatic de-
velopments accept the compatibility between in-
commensurability and the simultaneous existence of
several paradigms in (preparadigmatic) social fields
(Johnson and Duberley 2000). For instance, Burrell
and Morgan (1979) abstract the paradigm concept as
a set of assumptions related to ontology, epistemol-
ogy, human nature and methodology. Using a four-
quadrant matrix scheme outlined by two fundamen-
tal debates in its axes (the objectivist vs. subjectivist
philosophy of science and the sociology of regulation
vs. the sociology of change), these authors suggest
the simultaneous existence of four meta-paradigms in
social fields: functionalist (objective–regulation), in-
terpretive (subjective–regulation), radical humanism
(subjective–radical change) and radical structuralism
(objective–radical change).

Although the framework of Burrell and Morgan
(1979) has been ‘critiqued’ (Willmott 1993), it has
also been ‘defended’ (Jackson and Carter 1991,
1993). Many scholars have organized the social
sciences around paradigms following the legacies of
Burrell and Morgan’s (1979) classification (Baronov
2016; Blaikie 2007; Blaikie and Priest 2017; Cunliffe
2011; Deetz 1996; Gephart 2004; Johnson and Du-
berley 2000; Lincoln et al. 2018; Scherer et al. 2015).
Consequently, Burrell and Morgan’s (1979) frame-
work remains a reference (Cunliffe 2011, p. 649) and
constitutes ‘a good map to navigate the theory plu-
ralism of strategy…’ (Scherer 1998, p. 153). How-
ever, the methods of philosophically theorizing in
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organization theory have changed since Burrell and
Morgan’s (1979) model was first introduced, which
has eroded the subjectivity–objectivity division and
stimulated the legitimation of not only a number of
synthetic perspectives – such as the structuration
theory and critical realism – but also the postmodern
turn (Hassard 2016; Hassard and Cox 2013).

In this advancement, some paradigms have shown
confluence (Lincoln et al. 2018). As a result,
the boundaries between some of the traditional
paradigms became conceivable only for analytical
convenience. Thus, the blurring of boundaries be-
tween the interpretive and critical approaches to so-
cial inquiry (Prasad and Prasad 2002) resulted in
the critical ethnography and critical hermeneutic po-
sitions, among others (Prasad 2005). Moreover, so-
called ‘post traditions’ also have strong connections
to and affinities with critical traditions (Prasad 2005;
Willmott 2005), which has led some scholars to
treat them as part of the same group (Alvesson and
Deetz 2000, 2006). Consequently, the work of Bur-
rell and Morgan (1979) has been extended (Gioia and
Pitre 1990; Morgan and Smircich 1980) and revisited
(Cunliffe 2011; Deetz 1996; Hassard and Cox 2013).

This paper adopts a definition that describes
paradigms ‘… as universally recognized scientific
achievements that provide model problems and so-
lutions by referring to a certain methodology and
meta-theoretical assumptions’ (Rasche 2008, p. 35).
Accordingly, this study analyses both the meta-
theoretical assumptions (ontology, epistemology, hu-
man nature and methodology) and Kuhn’s (1970)
basic paradigmatic assumptions regarding central
constructs (e.g. strategy, environment, firm and
strategist) that strategy researchers attach to their
frameworks to determine the model problem and its
solution. In this way, this study takes the following
paradigms as a starting point: positivist, critical re-
alist, interpretive, critical theory and postmodernist
(Table 1).

Methodology

The present paper follows a multiple-step research
process to isolate the main paradigms in strategy re-
search. The process starts from a systematic litera-
ture review methodology (Tranfield et al. 2003) and
includes multiple steps. The first step follows Kuhn
(1970, p. 176), who suggests that ‘scientific com-
munities can and should be isolated without prior
recourse to paradigms; the latter can then be dis-

covered by scrutinizing the behaviour of a given
community’s members’. Citation patterns were sug-
gested as a potential approach to detecting paradigms
(Nerur et al. 2008). Thus, a dataset of relevant
articles was identified, and the related bibliomet-
ric information was downloaded to conduct a co-
citation analysis to recognize these invisible colleges
(Vogel 2012) that share ‘formal and informal com-
munication networks, including those discovered in
correspondence and in the linkages among citations’
(Kuhn 1970, p. 178). Based on the resulting co-
citation network, the main theories in strategic man-
agement were identified, and basic assumptions of
these theories were isolated (based on the content
analysis of key sources). The next step includes an
analysis that groups the main theories into meta-
paradigms based on their onto-epistemological as-
sumptions.

In this context, the data collection follows a two-
step approach. First, the bibliometric information of
the 2774 articles published in the Strategic Manage-
ment Journal (SMJ) since 1980 was first downloaded
(available in Elsevier’s Scopus database on 19 August
2019). To guarantee plurality, the main keywords in
these articles (Table 2) were used to identify a second
sample of 3330 articles from the journals included in
the Academic Journal Guide 2018 (AJG3, AJG4 and
AJG4* journals) by introducing selected keywords
into Elsevier’s Scopus search engine.

A co-citation analysis was conducted to repre-
sent the intellectual structure of the field. Co-citation
analysis has been used to analyse both the entire field
of strategic management (Nerur et al. 2008; Ramos-
Rodríguez and Ruíz-Navarro 2004) and different the-
ories within the field, such as the resource-based view
(Acedo et al. 2006) and the dynamic capabilities ap-
proach (Di Stefano et al. 2010; Vogel and Güttel
2013). Following Nerur et al. (2008), we chose au-
thor co-citation analysis because it best represents
the social construction of the research field (Zupic
and Čater 2015). By analysing the number of times
that a pair of authors are cited together in the same
document, the method aims to identify not only con-
tributors who offer similar ideas but also boundary-
spanning scholars (Nerur et al. 2008). Using the
VOSviewer software (van Eck et al. 2010), the co-
citation analysis is based on the core 750 authors who
meet the threshold of 100 citations. This threshold is
the optimal solution for coping with the trade-off be-
tween accuracy and clarity in the resulting picture.

Next, a set of substantive keywords was isolated
to find relevant articles regarding paradigms in the
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strategic management field (Table 2). We searched
for (published and in-press) articles from AJG3,
AJG4 and AJG4* journals by entering selected key-
words in the search engine of Elsevier’s Scopus. To
avoid obtaining unrelated articles, we required items
to contain a minimum of one of the selected primary
keywords in its title, keywords or abstract. To ensure
the articles’ substantive relevance, we also required
that each article include a minimum of one of the
selected supplementary words in their text (Newbert
2007).

The first round of searching returned 1625 hits.
Next, articles from unranked or low-ranked journals
(AJG1 and AJG2) were excluded. After scanning
for relevance by reviewing the abstracts, 230 articles
were preselected. The selection criteria included ar-
ticles that (1) explain the historical evolution of the
strategic management field, (2) discuss or bridge dif-
ferent schools or paradigms in the field, (3) discuss
contributions from another field to strategic manage-
ment or (4) focus on the research agenda at various
moments in time. Other major databases were used to
identify missing articles, such as ABI Inform Com-
plete, Ebsco, Emerald, Sage Journals, Springer and
Taylor & Francis Online. After adding 70 new items,
the final sample comprised 300 AJG3, AJG4 and
AJG4* articles. AJG1 and AJG2 journals, books and
book chapters were excluded from the search. Never-
theless, some articles from low-ranked or unranked
journals and several books were considered because
they explicitly discuss the foundations of the strat-
egy field (e.g. Kay et al. 2003; Pettigrew et al. 2002;
Rumelt et al. 1994; Whittington 2010).

Paradigms in strategic management

Business strategy emerged as a research arena in the
1960s (Rumelt et al. 1994). Andrews (1971), Ansoff
(1965) and Chandler (1962) are considered to be the
founding fathers of the strategy field (Furrer et al.
2008). Their classic models are jointly referred to as
the ‘business policy and planning’ research and rep-
resent the origins of the so-called design and plan-
ning strategy schools. In the 1960s, strategy research
was normative, and generalizations emerged from
case studies and were translated into practice due to
the intervention of large consulting firms (Ghemawat
2002; Rumelt et al. 1994). The 1970s witnessed
the slow takeover of the field by research rooted
in organization theory, sociology and political sci-
ence, which was conceptually based on various the-

ories such as population ecology (Hannan and Free-
man 1977), contingency theory (Burns and Stalker
1961; Lawrence and Lorsch 1967) and resource de-
pendence theory (Pfeffer and Salancik 1978). New
insights into organizational economics also entered
the strategy discussion. In particular, transaction cost
economics (Williamson 1975) and agency theory
(Fama and Jensen 1983; Jensen and Meckling 1976)
influenced the development of strategy inquiry. The
‘brewing’ studies (Hatten and Schendel 1977; Hatten
et al. 1978) linked organizational resource choices
and firm performance by emphasizing the impor-
tance of firm heterogeneity and conduct and the rel-
evance of environmental factors. Moreover, schol-
ars from Harvard’s Economics Department (Caves
and Porter 1977; Hunt 1972) who were linked to
the IO tradition reinterpreted the structure–conduct–
performance (SCP) paradigm of Bain (1951, 1956)
and Mason (1939).

Influenced by IO research, the positioning ap-
proach (Buzzle et al. 1975; Gale and Branch
1982; Henderson 1970) – particularly Porter’s (1980)
framework – became dominant in the 1980s and early
1990s (Prahalad and Hamel 1994, p. 15). Firm per-
formance was assumed to rest on a firm’s capacity to
create and sustain a competitive advantage with re-
spect to its competitors in the same industry or, that
is, on how well the firm positions and differentiates
itself in the industry (Hoskisson et al. 1999, p. 426).
The resource-based view (RBV) (Barney 1991; Pe-
teraf 1993; Wernerfelt 1984), which emerged in the
late 1980s, implied a refocus on the firm (Hoskisson
et al. 1999, p. 241). The RBV argues that a firm’s
unique resources and capabilities explicate the pos-
session of a competitive and sustainable advantage
over competitors (Barney 1991). Additionally, draw-
ing on Polanyi’s (1962, 1967) distinction between ex-
plicit and tacit knowledge, the knowledge-based view
(KBV) brought other discussions to the field, includ-
ing ideas such as organizational learning, knowledge
creation and knowledge management (Cohen and
Levinthal 1990; Grant 1996; Kogut and Zander 1992;
Nonaka and Takeuchi 1995). Finally, the dynamic ca-
pability view (DCV) (Eisenhardt and Martin 2000;
Helfat et al. 2007; Teece et al. 1997) incorporated the
contributions of the ‘Kirznerian, Schumpeterian, and
evolutionary theories of economic change’ (Teece
2007, p. 1325).

Strategy scholars typically differentiate between
the research on the strategy content and the research
on the strategy process; the former focuses on link-
ing decisions and structures to outcomes, and the

© 2020 The Authors. International Journal of Management Reviews published by British Academy of Management and
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latter focuses on activities that drive and sustain the
strategy (Huff and Reger 1987). After its initial dom-
inance in the 1960s, the strategy process research
developed in the shadow of the above-described
economics-based strategy content research. From the
late 1970s to the early 1990s, strategy process re-
search was dominated by simple and holistic (Bower
1970; Galbraith 1977; Miles and Snow 1978; Van
de Ven et al. 1989) studies grounded in contingency
theory and the concept of ‘fit’ (Chakravarthy and
Doz 1992, p. 8). These empirical studies integrate a
body of research that gained momentum (Donaldson
1987; Fredrickson 1986; Hinings and Greenwood
1988; Miller 1986, 1987; Miller and Friesen 1984;
Mintzberg 1979; Tushman and Romanelli 1985) and
persisted even later (Amburgey and Dacin 1994;
Miller 1996; Short et al. 2008). In addition, a group
of cognition scholars (Walsh 1995) built on the works
of the Carnegie tradition (Cyert and March 1963) and
applied ‘cognitive and social psychology to strategic
management theory and practice’ in what Powell
et al. (2011) call the ‘behavioral strategy’ school.
Cognitive theories focus on ‘knowledge structures,
memory, attention, attribution, and problem solving’
(Huff et al. 2000, p. 29).

The late 1980s and early 1990s witnessed a reduc-
tion in the traditional process research on strategic
planning (Whittington and Cailluet 2008), whereas a
group of scholars (Burgelman 1991; Chaffee 1985;
Mintzberg 1994; Pettigrew 1992; Quinn 1989; Van
de Ven 1992) introduced new ‘perspectives based on
politics, sociology and organization theory’ (Booth
1998, p. 257). This evolution involved a departure
from the prescriptive planning and design schools
and a conceptual migration toward a greater recogni-
tion of the role of context, values, culture and politics
in strategic thinking (Ezzamel and Willmott 2004, p.
44). Introduced in the 1970s, the role of the emergent
approach was particularly relevant, whereas a set
of publications by Johnson (1987), Pettigrew (1985,
1992, 1997) and Van de Ven (Van de Ven 1992; Van
de Ven et al. 1989) can also be viewed as the seeds of
a fresh approach within the strategy process tradition.
Thus, European academics noted the need to move
‘beyond economics towards sociology’ with a plural-
ist ‘post-Mintzberian’ agenda (also see Jarzabkowski
and Whittington 2008; Vaara and Whittington 2012).
Thus, the strategy-as-practice (s-as-p) strand of re-
search became the most recent approach to extend
the traditional strategy process views.

The largest part of the above consummated strat-
egy content and process research has its origins in

informal collegial networks (Crane 1972) that facil-
itate the organization and intellectual advancement
of a scholarly domain (Vogel 2012). Through so-
cial processes, the members of a scientific commu-
nity contribute to building and legitimating the field
of knowledge (Hambrick and Chen 2008; Whitley
1984a). Scholarly communities, their key members
and their theoretical underpinnings and behaviour
must be identified before isolating paradigms (Kuhn
1970).

Structuring strategic management research

Based on the author co-citation analysis, this paper
broadly overviews the intellectual structure of the
field after 50 years of evolution to isolate different
scholarly communities in strategy research. The co-
citation network exposes four scholarly communities
(Figure 1). At the top is (1) the literature on top
management teams and corporate governance (e.g.
Hambrick, Hitt, Zajac). At the bottom is the research
on (2) the strategy process and strategic decision-
making (right-hand side, e.g. Eisenhardt, Miller,
Mintzberg), (3) competitive strategy and competi-
tive advantage (middle, e.g. Barney, Porter, Teece)
and (4) international business and strategic alliances
(left-hand side, e.g. Gulati, Kogut, Singh). Commu-
nities 1 and 4 focus on corporate strategy, commu-
nity 2 focuses on competitive strategy and commu-
nity 3 brings together studies with these two focuses
(Feldman 2020). Although these communities in-
volve diverse research streams, the network showing
the communities was selected for the sake of clarity.
These communities are separated by structural holes
but bridged by ‘boundary-spanning’ (Nerur et al.
2008) members (e.g. Barney, Eisenhardt, Hambrick,
Hitt, Kogut, March, Pffefer, Williamson).

Theories and their basic assumptions

In accordance with the historical evolution of the
strategy domain, an analysis of the intellectual struc-
ture of the strategy field reveals the multidisciplinary
roots of the strategic management field. Numerous
theories have been used, many of which were born
within the strategic management field, while other
theories were borrowed from other disciplines (Ken-
worthy and Verbeke 2015). Although a co-citation
analysis reveals the use of a large number of theories,
not all have the same degree of popularity (see Table
A1 in the Appendix for a comprehensive list). Ken-
worthy and Verbeke (2015, p. 181) recently identified

© 2020 The Authors. International Journal of Management Reviews published by British Academy of Management and John
Wiley & Sons Ltd.
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Figure 1. The intellectual structure of the strategy field [Colour figure can be viewed at wileyonlinelibrary.com]

194 theories in strategic management but found that
‘only ten theories were tested more than ten times’.

As shown in Table 3, some theories are more pop-
ular and are used by different communities. The co-
citation network yields evidence of two types of the-
ories (for more details on the interpretation of the
co-citation network, see Table A1 in the Appendix).
First, ‘exogenous theoretical influences’ (Nerur et al.
2008) from organization economics are commonly
used as conceptual apparatuses to build frameworks
and to test particular hypotheses (e.g. agency theory,
transaction cost economics, population ecology, in-
stitutional theory and resource dependence theory).
Second, endogenous theories were developed within
the strategic management field, such as the SCP
framework (IO), RBV, KBV, DCV, the competitive
dynamics approach and the strategy process stream
of research.

The above-listed theories coincide with the theo-
ries pointed out by previous review studies as the

most relevant in strategic management (Furrer et al.
2008; Kenworthy and Verbeke 2015; Nerur et al.
2008; Ramos-Rodríguez and Ruíz-Navarro 2004).
However, understanding the manner in which re-
searchers construct the ‘world of strategy’ based on
the different assumptions that they attach to their
strategic realities (Rasche 2008, p. 3) is a neces-
sary step in the identification of paradigms. Accord-
ingly, Table 3 summarizes the basic assumptions in-
cluded in the ‘Kuhnian’ model problem of the above-
identified approaches to strategy (Tables A2 and A3
in the Appendix offer an in-depth look at the basic as-
sumptions that underlie the endogenous approaches).

Meta-paradigms and their assumptions

Until the publication of the foundational studies by
Ansoff (1965), Chandler (1962) and Learned et al.
(1965), strategy was characterized by pragmatic real-
ism over abstraction, and normative generalizations

© 2020 The Authors. International Journal of Management Reviews published by British Academy of Management and
John Wiley & Sons Ltd.
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Figure 2. Onto-epistemological positions in strategy research [Colour figure can be viewed at wileyonlinelibrary.com]

were proposed based on the case studies of organiza-
tional success. Although ‘[in] the 1960s, there was a
more coherent and widely accepted set of premises,
assumptions, instruments, and techniques that were
well known as the business policy framework’
(Scherer 1998, p. 148), the strategy field was ‘striving
for status’ ‘until about 1980’ (Hambrick and Chen
2008, p. 38). Certainly, there are conceptual differ-
ences in the three foundational works. Ansoff and
Andrews were influenced by Chandler’s strategy–
structure model (Harris and Ruefli 2000) and fo-
cused on the development of tools and best prac-
tices through the application of an inductive research
methodology (essentially, case studies), and the work
of Chandler and Ansoff was ‘notable for its ratio-
nalism and driving economic determinism’ (Whipp
1999, p. 11). Indeed, Chandler’s (1962) empiricist
and positivistic approach (Amitabh and Gupta 2010)
was designated the cornerstone of Cartesian philoso-
phy in the field of strategy (Clegg et al. 2004, p. 22).

After a shift towards a more rigorous conceptu-
alization of science in the 1970s, which included
theory borrowing from organization theory, sociol-
ogy, political science and organizational economics,
strategic management became accepted as a scien-
tific field in the early 1980s. Donaldson (1995, p.

23) acknowledges the paradigmatic differences be-
tween organizational economics and organizational
sociology (in terms of their core theoretical stories
and propositions, language and methods). Regard-
less, the move towards a new research style involved
deductive (rather than inductive) methods for test-
ing hypotheses, large databases, multivariate statis-
tical methods, econometric analysis and the predom-
inance of Popper’s falsification philosophy (Rumelt
et al. 1991, p. 8), which currently dominates the field
(Foss and Hallberg 2017).

Considering a paradigm to be a complete view of
reality (Morgan 1980), the analysis moves from theo-
ries (and their basic assumptions) to paradigms based
on meta-theoretical assumptions (ontology, episte-
mology, human nature and methodology). The anal-
yses confirm the dominance of a group of theo-
ries, which, based on their basic assumptions, expose
four meta-paradigms. The main meta-paradigms
are (1) contemporary positivism (a realist, posi-
tivistic and functionalist paradigm), (2) contempo-
rary realism, (3) interpretive paradigms (hermeneu-
tic/interpretive/social constructionism) and (4) criti-
cal postmodernism (Figure 2). Next, this paper re-
views how different academics engaged with these
meta-paradigms considering the previously recog-
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nized post-Burrell and Morgan paradigmatic conflu-
ence (Cunliffe 2011; Hassard and Cox 2013; Prasad
2005; Willmott 2005).

The contemporary positivist meta-paradigm. Fol-
lowing Scherer and Dowling (1995), the first meta-
paradigm is labelled ‘contemporary positivism’. This
paradigm embodies ‘the dominant linear and ratio-
nal approaches to strategy’ (Booth 1998, p. 258).
By drawing on the hypothetical–deductive tradition
(Martinet 2008), corporate strategy models ‘relied
on the Cartesian paradigm’ (Calori 1998, p. 285),
employed static assumptions from neoclassical eco-
nomics and the IO tradition as the primary con-
ceptual framework (Chakravarthy and Doz 1992)
and reduced contexts to a set of contingent vari-
ables (Martinet 2008). Smircich and Stubbart (1985,
p. 724) note that in mainstream strategic manage-
ment research, ‘the objective environment [as as-
sumed by strategic choices and environmental deter-
minists] may be accurately [rationality] or inaccu-
rately perceived [bounded rationality], but in either
case, the task of strategic managers is to maintain
congruence between environmental constraints and
organizational needs’ (text in italics added). Single-
reality organizations, their resources and their (de-
terministic) environments are conceived as given
and detached entities; they are external to both re-
searchers and strategies, their relationships follow
quasi-universal fixed causal laws that apply across
time and space, and they can be studied by applying
the methods of natural science (Blaikie 2007; Scherer
and Dowling 1995). Because of the dominance of this
worldview, the strategic management field has been
described as prematurely stuck in a ‘normal science
straightjacket’ (Bettis 1991, p. 315).

Although the underlying sets of core assumptions
attached to the model problems of the schools in-
cluded in this paradigm reveal some differences in
scholars’ strategic realities, these contemporary pos-
itivist traditions share or at least do not challenge
a conventional understanding of strategizing. Given
the many nuances discussed by Donaldson (1996),
who concludes that contingency theory is the only
fully positivist perspective if a strict approach is
adopted in the assessment, these approaches build
on a few taken-for-granted implicit assumptions
(Rasche 2008). First, the ideas of fit and adaptation
view the ‘organization and environment as two sep-
arate entities’ (Rasche 2008, p. 4), rest on the as-
sumption of a ‘given’, ‘objective’ and ‘unique’ (one-
for-all) environment and accept the existence of (a

certain level of) environmental determinism. Sec-
ond, the existence of linear, rational and deliberate
thinking requires the separation of strategy formu-
lation (the CEO/planners) and strategy implemen-
tation (middle management) into two different en-
tities (Rasche 2008). Third, the ‘fullness of strate-
gic rules and resources’ indicates the existence of
‘generalizable’ and ‘decontextualized’ solutions to
strategic research problems (Rasche 2008), such as
Andrews’ (1971) SWOT analysis, Barney’s (1991)
VRIN/O analysis and the generic strategies of Miles
and Snow (1978) and Porter (1980).

The underlying ‘realistic’ ontological assumptions
and modernist/positivist epistemology are at the core
of many approaches to and theories of the firm
that have influenced strategic management research
since the late 1970s (Burrell and Morgan 1979;
French 2009; Johnson and Duberley 2000). This
worldview follows what Burrell and Morgan (1979)
call the subject–object model of inquiry (Scherer
and Dowling 1995) and other modes of explana-
tion, such as functionalism and rational choice theory
(Scherer 2005). Relevant examples are transaction
cost economics, agency theory (from organizational
economics) and Miles and Snow’s (1978) typology
of strategic action (Mir and Watson 2000). This
paradigm also encompasses diverse strategy con-
tent approaches, such as the positioning school and
Porter’s strategy typology, the RBV approach (Ezza-
mel and Willmott 2008; Mir and Watson 2000), com-
petitive dynamics, strategy–structure streams (which
originated from Chandler’s contingent approach) and
the configurational approach (Ezzamel and Will-
mott 2008). For example, Porter’s economic theory
of strategy builds on a realist ontology and a pos-
itivist epistemology, assumes (moderate) determin-
ism (with only a minor opportunity to change struc-
ture through conduct) and uses a nomothetic method-
ology that combines modelling with case studies
(Hoskisson et al. 1999; Rasche 2008; Smircich and
Stubbart 1985). Although the RBV was considered
to be a new paradigm (Rasche 2008; Rouse and Dael-
lenbach 1999), Booth (1998, p. 258) concludes that
‘there are no apparent ontological, epistemological or
methodological differences’ between proponents of
the RBV and the ‘hitherto dominant “design”, “plan-
ning” and “positioning” schools’. French (2009, p.
64) expresses a similar viewpoint and concludes that
the ideas of the RBV ‘remain firmly bounded in the
linear Modernist paradigm’. Above all, the content-
driven approaches to strategy share ‘assumptions of
economic rationality and Newtonian conceptions of
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equilibrium and stability’ (MacIntosh and MacLean
1999, p. 298).

Although Furrer et al. (2008, p. 4) conclude that
the strategy process and content approaches draw
on ‘very different ontological and epistemological
perspectives’, many strategy process approaches are
part of the positivist paradigm. Examples include
the planning and design schools (Ezzamel and Will-
mott 2008), which gather a number of positivist em-
pirical process studies that were conducted in the
late 1970s and early 1980s (Lorange 1980; Lorange
and Vancil 1977; Steiner 1979; Vancil and Lorange
1975) and Van de Ven’s dialectic studies on the strat-
egy process (Sminia 2009). Although it has been de-
scribed as embracing empirical realism as a research
orientation (Sminia 2009), strategy as an emergent
process (Mintzberg and Waters 1985) is a different
case and has been classified as part of the interpre-
tive paradigm (Rantakari and Vaara 2016). In any
case, according to Knights and Mueller (2004, p. 57),
the classic process school is unable to problematize
‘the clear cut separation between planning and im-
plementation or between organization and environ-
ment’. In addition, although strategies are decided,
there is ‘a failure to theorize the changing identities
of corporate decision makers’. Therefore, Knights
and Morgan (1991, p. 267) conclude that ‘despite
criticisms of linear explanations of social and orga-
nizational practices’, process theory ‘has a leaning
toward causal analysis that prevents it from following
the full logic of a hermeneutic epistemology’ and the-
orists ‘still cling to certain positivist attempts to iden-
tify and perhaps measure causal processes…’. The
remaining paradigms were developed in response to
the dominant rational models (Calori 1998).

The contemporary realist meta-paradigm. The next
meta-paradigm is labelled ‘contemporary realism’.
According to Cunliffe (2011), contemporary realists
are a broad group, which in the case of strategy in-
quiry includes approaches with objectivist ontology
and subjectivist epistemology, such as critical real-
ists (Miller and Tsang 2010) and strategy pragmatism
(Powell 2002, 2003). Cunliffe (2011) also includes
several other approaches in this meta-paradigm, such
as critical theory and (anti-essentialist) actor network
theory (ANT). However, due to the manner in which
their ideas have been used in the field of strategic
management, this paper focuses only on the critical
realist philosophical position (and the related work
of certain process theorists). For instance, although
the present study acknowledges that different au-

thors view ANT as a poststructural position (Hassard
and Cox 2013), strategy contributors to ANT are in-
cluded in the ‘transition zone’ between the critical
realist and interpretative worldviews. Instead, some
discursive forms of critical realists are clustered in
this study with critical scholars as part of the ap-
proach called critical postmodernism (Alvesson and
Deetz 2006).

Among the contemporary realist approaches, inter-
est in critical realism has been increasing (Miller and
Tsang 2010). Critical realism is ‘a meta-theoretical
paradigm focused on explanations of the underly-
ing “generative mechanisms or structures” that shape
corporate agency and the social relations that it re-
produces and transforms’; it emerged in opposition
to the ‘radical or strong social constructionist pro-
gramme’ that has underpinned the ‘linguistic turn’
(Reed 2005, p. 1623). However, these philosophical
positions do not fully represent irreconcilable pro-
grammes. Indeed, Reed (2009, p. 97) identifies three
critical realist research streams that have influenced
critical management studies (CMS). First, an ethno-
graphic stream focuses on micropolitical power re-
lations. Second is a research stream ‘combining his-
torical, comparative and discursive forms of analy-
sis’. Third, a final stream studies ‘organizational dis-
courses and ideologies’ and the ‘performative impact
of discursive practices’ followed by the contributors
to Fairclough’s (2005) critical realist approach – that
is critical discourse analysis (CDA).

Starting in the early 1990s, critical realism (Archer
1995; Bhaskar 1986) became an alternative approach
to organization and management research (Fleet-
wood 2005; Miller and Tsang 2010; Reed 2005). De-
parting from Giddens, Bhaskar ascribes ‘primacy to
structure rather than structuration’ and criticizes Gid-
dens ‘for being too voluntaristic’ (Pozzebon 2004, p.
251). Thus, compared to Giddens’ structuration ap-
proach, ‘Bhaskar’s realist ontology produces a cat-
egorical distinction between human action and so-
cial structure, seeing them as fundamentally differ-
ent’ (Pozzebon 2004, p. 250). Although there are
fewer adherents of Bhaskar than adherents of Gid-
dens, the critical realist approach has gained support
in the strategic management field but still remains
underrepresented among strategy studies (Kwan and
Tsang 2001; Mahoney and Snyder 1999; Miller and
Tsang 2010; Tsang and Kwan 1999). For instance,
in certain cases, s-as-p scholars have also applied the
critical realist approach (Herepath 2014; Whittington
1989).
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The interpretive meta-paradigm. The third meta-
paradigm comprises studies that adopt an interpretive
position or follow different degrees of constructivist
engagement. As noted by Mir and Watson (2000),
a trace of a constructivist position can further be
found in studies by diverse scholars across the strat-
egy communities discussed in this study (Burgelman
1983; Doz 1996; Hamel and Prahalad 1989; Kogut
and Zander 1992). Indeed, strategy scholars intellec-
tualize the interpretive paradigm as built on a spec-
trum of various onto-epistemological positions that
range from hermeneutics, phenomenology and eth-
nomethodology to the Giddesian structuration theory
(ST) and Bourdeausian praxeology (these last two
approaches are located at the intersection of meta-
paradigms). This diversity has been acknowledged
by Mir and Watson (2001, p. 1173) and Kwan and
Tsang (2001, p. 1164), who recognize perspectives
that range from realism to relativism. In the above
spectrum, located in the ‘transition zone’ (Gioia and
Pitre 1990) between the contemporary realist and in-
terpretative philosophical positions, one finds con-
structivist studies that adopt a ‘moderate construc-
tivism’ compatible with realism (Blaikie 2007; Kwan
and Tsang 2001). Resulting from strategy scholars’
use of different approaches to social enquiry, this
view was considered to be an approach that ‘can be
accommodated within a critical realist framework’
(Kwan and Tsang 2001, p. 1163).

Drawing on an idealist ontology (with a kernel of
subtle realism) and a constructionist epistemology
(Blaikie 2007, p. 157), the Giddesian ST approach
could be located in the ‘transition zone’. By assum-
ing ‘methodological individualism’ and ‘a Cartesian
split between the mental and the physical’, this
epistemological ‘building worldview’ relies on an
interpretive approach. Among its premises, this view
assumes that ‘knowledge is construed as the ability
to represent the world around us in the mind in the
form of mental images’ and sees ‘strategy making
as a deliberate, intentional and goal-driven activity’.
In addition, this view assumes that ‘the individual
and society are construed as self-contained entities
interacting externally with each other’ (Chia and
Rasche 2010, p. 34).

Through Giddens, the structurationist perspective
‘was already influential in management and organi-
zation studies, particularly as encapsulated in “pro-
cessual” approaches’ (Johnson et al. 2007, p. 15),
as shown by Pozzebon’s (2004) review. For instance,
being influenced by the work of Giddens and sub-
scribing to the social constructionist worldview, Pet-

tigrew’s (1997) processual analysis has been de-
scribed as adopting a critical realist research orien-
tation (Sminia 2009; Sminia and de Rond 2012). A
germ of a constructivist position can also be found
in the scaffolding of institutional theory (Scott 1987)
and new institutionalism, for instance, through Gid-
dens’ ideas (Edwards 2016) and Bourdeau’s influ-
ence (Dimaggio and Powell 1991). The article by
Oakes et al. (1998) is an example of strategy research
(Prasad 2005). In addition, some s-as-p studies have
used the institutional macro-mechanisms that under-
lie behaviours to understand the interplay between in-
dividual activities at the micro-level, the organization
at the meso-level and the organizational field at the
macro-level (Suddaby et al. 2013).

The Giddesian ST is particularly present in the
‘conventional distinction between praxis and prac-
tice’ (Whittington 2010, p. 119) and constitutes, with
the Bordieusian praxeology (Bourdieu 1977, 1990)
and de Certeau’s theory on practice (de Certeau
1984), a central component of the conceptual scaf-
folding of the first generation of s-as-p studies that
focus on social practices and on how managers ac-
tually implement strategy, or the ‘doings’ in strat-
egy (Whittington 1996, 2003, 2018). Indeed, ST be-
came a key approach to study the interplay between
micro-activities and macro-outcomes and abandon
the dichotomist view on the structure–action debate
(Seidl and Whittington 2014). Whittington (2010)
shows how insights from the Giddesian approach
have been extensively applied (Kaplan 2008; Man-
tere 2008; Paroutis and Pettigrew 2007) and com-
bined with other theories, such as dynamic capa-
bilities (Salvato 2003), sensemaking (Balogun and
Johnson 2005; Rouleau 2005) and institutional the-
ory (Jarzabkowski 2008).

Many s-as-p studies have also followed the in-
terpretive paradigm (Ezzamel and Willmott 2008)
to create different understandings of practice and
strategy based on social constructionist epistemology
(Balogun 2005; Wolf and Floyd 2013) and on ‘in-
timate methodologies’ (e.g. ethnographic methods),
whereas other studies use alternative epistemologi-
cal approaches (Chia and Rasche 2010) or different
degrees of constructivist engagement (Grand et al.
2010). The interpretive onto-epistemological posi-
tion is maintained by the work of different scholars
involved in decision-making and strategy process re-
search, which ‘emphasizes interpretative approaches
to managerial cognition and enactment’ (Booth 1998,
p. 259). Favouring the idea of a ‘socially created
symbolic world’ that abandons ‘concrete, material
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organizations/environments’ (Smircich and Stubbart
1985, p. 727), ‘interpretive research uncovers, de-
scribes and theoretically interprets actual meanings
that people use in real settings’ (Gephart 2004, p.
457). Illustrations can be found in cognitive and
sensemaking studies (Barr et al. 1992; Gioia and
Chittipeddi 1991; Weick et al. 2005), although sense-
making scholars have mixed onto-epistemological
assumptions and oscillate and act over time like ‘…
interpretivists, functionalist, radical humanists, and
radical structuralist’ (Weick 1995, p. 35). Some s-
as-p scholars have used the Weickian idea of sense-
making to scrutinize strategizing processes from the
bottom up, where middle managers’ cognition plays
an active role in retrospectively and prospectively
constructing the emergent strategic logic of an orga-
nization through collective and socially constructed
processes of shared understanding and sensemaking
(Rouleau 2005; Rouleau and Balogun 2011).

Other s-as-p studies that apply Vygotsky’s (1978)
activity theory and the situated learning approach
(Lave and Wenger 1991) are also part of the inter-
pretive paradigm (Jarzabkowski 2003, 2005; Mietti-
nen and Virkkunen 2005; Orlikowski 2002). Increas-
ingly popular among scholars in the social practice
stream of s-as-p (Balogun et al. 2015; Denis et al.
2007) is the ANT approach (Callon 1986; Latour
1987), which ‘adopts a semiotic of materiality’ to
examine the link between ‘human and non-human
actors’, where non-human actors are referred to as
‘objects’ (Cunliffe 2011, p. 655). Along with tech-
nology studies in information systems research and
the activity theory of Vygotsky and Leontiev, the La-
tourian ANT provides the philosophical foundations
for a corpus of scholarship known as sociomateriality
(Jarzabkowski and Kaplan 2015; Kaplan 2011; Or-
likowski 2007). This stream of research understands
relations as the primary explanatory means of the
inquiry, challenging the ontological assumption of
technology–human separation, advocating for a re-
lational ontology (Orlikowski and Scott 2018) and
studying how technologies affect organizations and
their strategizing sociomaterial practices.

The critical postmodernist meta-paradigm. The
last onto-epistemological space embraces the work
of critical and postmodernist intellectuals (includ-
ing poststructuralism). The critical research on strat-
egy typically builds on the work of scholars from
the so-called Frankfurt School and many postmod-
ernist intellectuals. Accordingly, the last paradigm is
labelled critical postmodernism (Boje 1995; Gephart

2004) and comprises ‘critical and postmodern ap-
proaches to strategy’ (Booth 1998, p. 259). Criti-
cal postmodernism ‘describes dominant and subor-
dinated meanings, displays the power implications
of meanings, and encourages critical reflexivity to
make people aware of the constraints on their own
meanings and actions. Critical reflexivity provides
a means for emancipation from structures of domi-
nation’ (Gephart 2004, p. 457). Nevertheless, some
connections exist (in a transition zone) with the third
paradigm. For instance, Gomez (2010) discusses how
the Bourdieusian structuration-like approach (Bour-
dieu 1977, 1990), which ascribes to a (structural)
constructivist epistemology, can be combined with
the critical position and is an alternative option for
discussing the primacy of agency or structure in
shaping human behaviour that has also been used
in s-as-p research (Chia and Holt 2006; Chia and
MacKay 2007).

Indications of the application of the critical post-
modernist approach to strategy can be traced back to
the early 1990s and are based mainly on the work
of many critical organization theorists (Alvesson and
Willmott 1995; Barry and Elmes 1997; Booth 2000;
Knights and Morgan 1991; Knights and Mueller
2004; Thomas 1998). Phillips and Dar (2009) dis-
tinguish four perspectives, namely, strategy as polit-
ical economy at the macro level of analysis, strat-
egy as ideology at the macro level, strategy as dis-
course at the meso/micro level and strategy as prac-
tice at the micro level. The two ‘macro-level’ strands
are the least exemplified in strategy research. Strat-
egy as political economy constitutes an alternative
line of inquiry to criticize strategic thinking based
on the Gramscian (historical–materialist hegemonic)
perspective (Gramsci 1971), which emphasizes the
importance of the economic context and advocates
for the indivisibility of markets and politics in re-
gard to understanding strategy and intrinsic asym-
metrical power relations (Levy et al. 2003). Inspired
by the structuration theory of Giddens (1979), Levy
et al. (2003) define a ‘modernist study’ of Shri-
vastava (1986) that is among the best-known uses
of the notion of strategy as an ideology in strate-
gic management; accordingly, strategy is defined as
an instrument that serves the interest of strategizing
(top) managers. Later, Thomas (1998) also defines
the strategy field as an ideological mélange.

The strategy-as-discourse stream typically repre-
sents the postmodern worldview based on a ‘Fou-
cauldian’ genealogical ontology (Ezzamel and Will-
mott 2008; Hardy and Thomas 2014; Knights and
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Morgan 1991; Sminia 2009). However, this perspec-
tive covers a spectrum of onto-epistemological po-
sitions oriented towards a subjectivist epistemology
(Chia and Rasche 2010) and involves different ap-
proaches that emphasize the use of the discourse
analysis method based on different discursive the-
ories (Balogun et al. 2014; Vaara 2010). In agree-
ment with the radical humanism paradigm (Burrell
and Morgan 1979) and inspired by Foucault’s work,
Alvesson and Deetz’s (2006) so-called critical man-
agement studies (CMS) challenge the ‘authority of
managerialism’ and identify ‘discourse as a coher-
ent system of knowledge that rules in certain ways of
thinking, doing, and being’ (Phillips et al. 2008, p.
778).

In the early 2000s, different discourse approaches
within the ‘linguistic turn’ in social sciences were
seen as both an important avenue for expanding
the s-as-p research agenda (Seidl and Whittington
2014, p. 1408) and ‘building a distinctive identity’
(Vaara and Whittington 2012, p. 290). At the mi-
cro level of analysis (though evolving towards the
macro–micro connection) and out of the traditional
scope of the conventional CMS, this research blends
cognitive approaches to discourse analysis with s-
as-p research (Phillips and Dar 2009) and empha-
sizes the performative role of discourse and organiza-
tions as polyphonic entities, which leads to the pres-
ence of various voices that compete for power. Thus,
this approach may enable a critical understanding of
how strategy discourse creates ‘regimes of truth and
power positions’ (Vaara 2010, p. 30). This discourse-
oriented stream of s-as-p research also involves sev-
eral methodological positions.

By embracing ethnomethodology to analyse prac-
tices through conversation analysis (CA), Samra-
Fredericks (2005) builds on Habermas’ (1979, 1984)
work to understand how speaking privileges allow
strategy makers to collaboratively construct power
(Nicolini 2012). Moreover, influenced by Foucault
(Phillips et al. 2008), other scholars (Vaara et al.
2010) follow Fairclough’s (1992) critical discourse
analysis (CDA) and take a critical realist stance
towards the analysed text, which moves the in-
quiry away from the relativist discursive form (Vaara
2010). Thus, CDA views the use of language ‘as
a form of social practice’ that ‘is shaped and con-
strained by social structures’ and ‘simultaneously
shapes the structures that constrain it’ (Phillips
et al. 2008, p. 771). Instead, by applying rhetori-
cal analysis, Suddaby and Greenwood (2005) build
on the neo-institutional approach to discuss alterna-

tive strategies of legitimacy. Finally, narrative anal-
ysis (Bakhtin 1986; Boje 2001, 2008; Czarniawska
2004) is an alternative fertile approach that explores
strategizing based on storytelling (Vaara 2010). A pi-
oneering example in the strategy context is the work
of Barry and Elmes (1997), and narrative analysis has
also gained interest among s-as-p scholars in recent
years (Fenton and Langley 2011; Küpers et al. 2013;
Vaara and Tienari 2011).

Other alternatives were also explored. Building on
the Heideggerian phenomenology and breaking with
the traditional actor-centred approach embedded in
the ‘first generation’ of s-as-p studies (Nicolini 2012,
pp. 21–22), scholars such as Chia, Holt and MacKay
(Chia and Holt 2006; Chia and MacKay 2007) sup-
port the adoption of what Nicolini (2012) refers to
as the ‘strong’ approach to s-as-p. Under this world-
view, ‘identities and characteristics of persons are
not deemed to pre-exist social interactions and so-
cial practices’ and ‘social practices themselves are
given primacy over individual agency and intention’
(Chia and Rasche 2010, p. 34). Some s-as-p stud-
ies have also applied the idea of language games
(Wittgenstein 1951), which see strategy as emerging
from coupled language games governed by context-
specific norms and where vocabularies and mean-
ings are considered context-specific and not transfer-
able to other contexts and discourses (Mantere 2013;
Seidl 2007). Finally, although less prevalent, Der-
rida’s (1972) deconstruction was also applied to strat-
egy research; Rasche (2008) is an example of the use
of this way of thinking.

Discussion and conclusions

The strategy field has been opening up for the last
20 years, which has resulted in many fresh research
topics and concepts and the acceptance of several dif-
ferent philosophical assumptions and methodologies.
Methodologies such as action research, ethnographic
research, narrative and discourse analysis, and in-
terventionist studies have increasingly been utilized.
Although our initial assumptions pointed to the
existence of a multidisciplinary and multiparadig-
matic field, positivist research, quantitative and (to
a small extent) qualitative, has strongly dominated
the strategy field and kept the research domain in its
‘straitjacket’ (Bettis 1991) for decades. Indeed, many
scholars still consider strategic management as a sin-
gle paradigm and suggest that theory is science only
if it meets ‘Popper’s falsifiability criterion’ (Bettis
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and Blettner 2020, p. 85). These circumstances call
for a deeper philosophical debate.

In this context, the present review sets out to
understand how different approaches to social en-
quiry have been used in strategy research and how
the main paradigms engage with strategy. The key
tasks include the delimitation of the key onto-
epistemological spaces and the recognition of the
different philosophical positions within them. These
tasks mean not only understanding how the spaces
could be delimited based on pre-existing paradig-
matic discussions, but also understanding how the
paradigmatic discussion has advanced in the field of
organizational inquiry; this debate was established in
the field over a decade ago, in contrast to the field of
strategic management.

Unlike most previous paradigmatic discussions in
the strategy field that matched paradigms to theo-
ries or schools of thought, this review considers a
paradigm to be a complete view of reality (Mor-
gan 1980). As a result, four onto-epistemological
spaces conceptualized as meta-paradigms emerged
from the analysis, which were labelled contempo-
rary positivist, contemporary realist, interpretive and
critical postmodernist. The first meta-paradigm – the
contemporary positivist – is the dominant view in
strategy. It embraces approaches that share realist
ontological assumptions and the modernist/positivist
epistemology and a few taken-for-granted underly-
ing assumptions such as the ideas of fit and adapta-
tion view, which reduce the context to a set of con-
tingent variables. Thus, organizations, their resources
and their (objective, unique and deterministic) envi-
ronments are conceived as given and detached enti-
ties; their relationships follow quasi-universal fixed
causal laws that apply across time and space.

The second meta-paradigm is the contemporary
realist, which comprises approaches with objectivist
ontology and subjectivist epistemology, such as crit-
ical realists and strategy pragmatism. In particular,
critical realism focuses on explanations of the un-
derlying structures (mechanisms) that form agency
and the social relations that it reproduces and trans-
forms. Third, the interpretive paradigm builds on a
spectrum of various onto-epistemological positions
and is maintained by scholars with different degrees
of constructivist engagement that leave behind mate-
rial and concrete organizations/environments and use
intimate methodologies. This meta-paradigm covers
positions ranging from hermeneutics, phenomenol-
ogy and ethnomethodology to Giddesian structura-
tion theory (ST), as well as cognitive studies and

new institutionalism. Finally, the critical postmod-
ernist meta-paradigm embraces the work of critical
and postmodernist intellectuals (including poststruc-
turalism). Thus, the fourth meta-paradigm covers a
spectrum of onto-epistemological positions oriented
towards constructivist and subjectivist epistemolo-
gies and involves several methodological positions,
many of which embrace ethnomethodology or phe-
nomenology and emphasize the use of the discourse
analysis method.

Considering the above meta-paradigms, the
present discussion section addresses the following
questions: (1) What is the degree of maturity of the
philosophical debate in the strategy research? (2)
How can scholars incorporate the findings of the
present review in the future development of strategy
research?

The meta-paradigms and philosophical debate in the
field

Each of the four onto-epistemological spaces (meta-
paradigms) covers several coexisting positions. Con-
sequently, different ‘paradigms’ (as traditionally de-
fined in the strategy field) might emerge through the
dissection of each meta-paradigm if one applies the
model problem type of the definition (Rasche 2008),
accepts the idea of weak incommensurability (Booth
1998) and equates the concept of paradigms to theo-
ries (Davis 2010; Donaldson 1996). Taking the con-
temporary positivist paradigm as a case in point, the
dissection requires an exploration of the differences
between the strategy process and content approaches,
which ‘address different phenomena’, and entails a
distinction between content theories (e.g. the market-
and resource-based views) that ‘address the same ex-
planandum phenomenon using widely explanatory
apparatuses’ (Foss 1996a, p. 4). In this context, the
analyst faces a ‘superficial’ pluralism because there
is a convergence in which most of the paradigms
favour ‘almost the same dominant meta-theoretical
assumptions… largely stemming from the function-
alist roots of the field’ (Rasche 2008, p. 98). The
designation of schools with similar meta-theoretical
worldviews as alternative paradigms may lead schol-
ars to consider ‘readjustments within functionalism’
(Johnson and Duberley 2000, p. 88) as paradigm
shifts (see Campbell-Hunt 2000, p. 127; Furrer et al.
2008, p. 11; Løwendahl and Revang 1998, p. 767;
Teece et al. 1997, p. 510).

The remaining three meta-paradigms could also
be divided into different positions. For instance, the
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contemporary realist meta-paradigm could be di-
vided into critical realism and pragmatism and the
critical postmodernist meta-paradigm into postmod-
ernist, poststructuralism, feminist and postcolonial-
ism. Moreover, the interpretive meta-paradigm builds
on a spectrum of various onto-epistemological po-
sitions that encompass traditions that range from
hermeneutics, phenomenology and ethnomethodol-
ogy to the Giddesian structuration theory (ST), which
are all recognized as paradigms by Blaikie (2007, p.
27).

As a result, the four meta-paradigms can be dis-
sected into many paradigms, whose number, in tak-
ing the exercise to the limit, would equal the to-
tal number of strategy schools or even theories. As
Eckberg and Hill (1980, p. 123) conclude, ‘the so-
ciological pie can be sliced in many ways’. Even
when strategy theories are considered paradigms,
there has only been a scattered philosophical de-
bate in the strategy field, and a ‘paradigm war’ has
not occurred. Given that the rational and emergent
traditions are built on very different sets of basic
assumptions, the debate between them in the early
1990s (Ansoff 1991; Mintzberg 1990a,b, 1991) not
only is a case in point but also shows that these al-
ternative streams have an ‘inability to satisfactorily
communicate’ (Foss 1996a, p. 6). Another example
is the debate on the fundamentals of resource-based
theory (Barney 2001a; Priem and Butler 2001a,b).
Feldman (2020) provides another illustration based
on the debate between academics from the IO and
RBV traditions, which materialized in a series of
variance decomposition studies looking for evidence
on the importance of industry and business unit ef-
fects on company performance. These debates re-
semble, for instance, the debate on organizational in-
quiry between the ‘environmental determinism’ pro-
posed by contingency theorists and population ecol-
ogists (Aldrich 1979; Dess and Beard 1986) and
the ‘managerial voluntarism’ proposed by strategic
choice scholars (Child 1972, 1997; Friend and Hick-
ling 2005). Of course, there have been discussions
at the philosophical level (Durand 2002; Kwan and
Tsang 2001; Mir and Watson 2000, 2001; Powell
2001, 2002), but most of them took place within the
meta-paradigms rather than between them.

In any case, the coexistence of alternative
paradigms introduces another difficult-to-resolve de-
bate that has been taking place in organizational in-
quiry around the concept of incommensurability. The
debate on incommensurability remains problematic,
reveals no consensual solution and exposes an in-

finite regression of arguments. As in organization
studies, the controversies over incommensurability in
strategy research find different postures (Shepherd
and Challenger 2013). Isolationists aim to safeguard
theoretical pluralism through an isolated evolution
of incommensurable paradigms, whereas paradigm
selection is a choice of belief that accepts the in-
solvability of incommensurability that comes from a
strong commitment to ontological and epistemolog-
ical assumptions (Jackson and Carter 1991). Schol-
ars have also proposed a back-to-basics approach
(Camerer 1985; Donaldson 1996) that empowers the
hegemony of the functionalist paradigm (Scherer and
Dowling 1995; Scherer and Steinmann 1999) and the
role of scientific gatekeepers to ensure the integration
and congruence of the scientific field (Pfeffer 1993).

Pluralists instead support a multiparadigmatic
state and call for a dialogue in which all voices can
be heard as a necessary condition for knowledge ac-
cumulation (Foss 1996b; Mahoney 1993; Pettigrew
et al. 2002; Rumelt et al. 1994; Schoemaker 1993;
Spender 1992; Thomas and Pruett 1993). By accept-
ing incommensurability and rejecting isolationism,
this position is a midpoint between the relativism
of anything goes and the dogmatism of back-to-
basics and creates a level of consensus among strate-
gic management scholars (Scherer 1998; Scherer
and Dowling 1995). Similarly, advocates of inte-
gration (Combe 1999; Cravens et al. 1997; Durand
et al. 2017; Hart 1992) consider the sum of multi-
ple paradigms to be better than a single paradigm.
Critiques of this approach claim that this integration
includes the sum of the gaps in each paradigm and
thus yields a sum worse than its separate perspectives
while providing little rationale for which paradigms
to integrate and neglect to address the reconcilabil-
ity of incommensurable perspectives, which leaves
substantial space for subjectivity and insufficient rec-
ommendations for reasoning (Scherer 1998). Integra-
tionist efforts exist, but they typically integrate theo-
ries within the positivist paradigm (Foss 1999). In-
deed, the meta-paradigms and the in-depth examina-
tion of the underlying and meta-theoretical assump-
tions of the main approaches may provide a sound
conceptual base to think about integration in a mul-
tiparadigmatic field in which onto-epistemological
boundaries are vanishing.

In summary, meta-paradigms have evolved in iso-
lation, with only a small number of concrete bridges.
As noted by Davis (2010), in organizational inquiry,
strategy meta-paradigms do not compete with one
another to account for the same regularities or events,
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which leads to the fragmentation of the strategy do-
main (Leiblein and Reuer 2020). Despite the clear
dominance of the positivist paradigm, the above situ-
ation has resulted in a ‘fragmented adhocracy’ (Whit-
ley 1984b) that comprises sharply bounded commu-
nities that draw on different disciplines, assumptions
and terminologies, which may hinder the integration
of the results (Whitley 1984a). Given these circum-
stances, recognizing that supposedly different ap-
proaches share some meta-theoretical worldviews is
the first step to finding bridges and dialogues within
the same meta-paradigm. Thus, the acknowledge-
ment of areas of dialogue between meta-paradigms
(or theories with different meta-theoretical assump-
tions) constitutes a relevant implication resulting
from the identification of the meta-paradigms.

Looking to the future

The findings of this review not only provide support
for scholars and doctoral students by helping them
navigate the foggy path of the philosophy of sci-
ence in a puzzling research landscape but also can
be used as a tool to extend strategy research. Open
to multidisciplinary ideas, ‘the field of strategic man-
agement is defined not by any particular theoretical
paradigm’ (Makadok et al. 2018, p. 1530) but rather
by a few main canonical questions about differences
in firms’ behaviour and performance, and the role of
and value added by firms’ top (and middle) manage-
ment (Leiblein and Reuer 2020; Rumelt et al. 1994).
Under these circumstances, most conceptual contri-
butions in strategic management do not initiate a rad-
ical paradigm shift but rather illuminate and advance
theories (either received or imported). Different onto-
epistemological positions will continue to coexist,
and ways to create synergies that result in better an-
swers to current and future canonical questions must
be found.

Looking ahead, there is an opportunity to fur-
ther explore some avenues already proposed by
researchers in organization studies and strategy.
Examples range from replacing paradigms with
discourses (Deetz 1996) to looking for spaces for
dialogue (Gioia and Pitre 1990) and trading zones
(Booth 2000). They also include creating a refer-
ence system that acts as a democratically created
dictionary (McKinley and Mone 1998) and adopting
a Campbellian realist philosophical position (McK-
elvey 1999), which is aligned with the constructivist
position of Mir and Watson (2000) and occupies a
space characterized by ontological realism and epis-

temological relativism. Alternatively, Rasche (2008,
p. 49) suggests the ‘loose coupling’ approach, which
allows researchers ‘to accept the logic of different
paradigms (and thus incommensurability) without
losing sight of the whole’. Finally, Drnevich et al.
(2020, p. 39) advocate for the strategy field’s return to
its primary focus on management practice that leads
to ‘scientifically rigorous and practically relevant
research that both develops new theoretical contri-
butions and bridges the theory–practice gap’. These
authors strongly encourage researchers to adopt
an abductive ‘problem-focused scholarly discovery
logic’ embracing the philosophy of pragmatism
(Dewey 1938) and theoretical and methodological
pluralism, including more qualitative and process
research (such as research that was conducted in the
1960s and 1970s, in the early stages of the field’s
development).

Most conceptual contributions in strategic man-
agement typically occur in a theoretical space and
from incremental changes in elements of the theo-
rizing process (Makadok et al. 2018). Therefore, ex-
posing and discussing the assumptions in strategic
management may serve as a guide for future concep-
tual development. Consequently, the present study
can inform theorizing in diverse manners. First, in the
construction of new research questions (or the mod-
ification of existing ones). Alvesson and Sandberg
(2011) introduce problematization, a concept that
aims to construct research questions from existing lit-
erature by identifying and challenging the taken-for-
granted assumptions underlying the prevailing theo-
ries through dialectical interrogation. Stimulated by
the paradigm debate, these authors recognize dif-
ferent types of assumptions open to problematiza-
tion. For instance, the in-home unproblematic as-
sumptions shared within a research stream, root
metaphors or broader images about the subject mat-
ter, paradigmatic assumptions (ontology, epistemol-
ogy and methodology), ideology (moral-, political-
and gender-related) and field assumptions shared by
many research streams (within a paradigm or even
across paradigms, e.g. rationality vs. bounded ra-
tionality). Although impactful theories most typi-
cally originate from challenging any of the latter
three types of broader assumptions, challenging these
types of premises is difficult and requires deepness
and precision. Although some approaches to inquiry,
such as social constructionism, postmodernism and
critical theory, often favour problematization (Alves-
son and Sandberg 2011), problematization is not the
dominant methodology in strategy research.
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Second, even in cases where the research ques-
tions do not emerge from problematization, under-
standing the assumptions underlying theories plays
a crucial role in determining their boundary con-
ditions, which defines when a theory does or does
not work and opens up opportunities for conceptual
development. Mastering these core assumptions is
needed to expose internal inconsistencies between
assumptions in one theory, identify logical incon-
sistencies between theories, and relax or restrict the
underlying assumptions of one approach to apply it
more broadly or to obtain more specific implications
(Makadok et al. 2018). Thus, the core assumptions
affect boundary conditions and, consequently, deter-
mine outputs. ‘The more specific the assumptions
and boundary conditions become, the more specific
the output can be’ (Makadok et al. 2018, p. 1539).
For instance, claim that research on s-as-p must as-
sume a ‘post-processual stance’ that ‘goes beyond
that of a sympathetic extension of the strategy pro-
cess perspective’. Such a stance must (1) place onto-
logical primacy on practices rather than actors, (2)
philosophically privilege practice complexes rather
than actors and things as the locus of analysis and (3)
make the locus of explanation the field of practices
rather than the intentions of individuals and organi-
zations.

Making explicit the underlying assumptions also
determines many other elements of the theorizing
process (Alvesson and Sandberg 2011), whereas a
contribution may come from adapting the assump-
tions to apply a given theory at a different level or
context than it originated or to understand a differ-
ent phenomenon. The assumptions underlying main-
stream strategic management theories were devel-
oped in the past. This situation calls for further con-
ceptual development to better understand contempo-
rary strategic management and to address novel phe-
nomena such as those emerging from the increasingly
rapid changes in the economic, political, social and
technological environments (He et al. 2020; Teece
2020). Finally, a phenomenon can be addressed with
different onto-epistemological approaches (e.g. using
different philosophical assumptions). For instance,
Wenzel et al. (2020) use a constructivist/processual
approach grounded on a practice perspective to il-
luminate the dynamics within dynamic capabilities,
a conception of organizational routines that usually
implicates a positivist/entitative onto-epistemology.

Limitations

The ambitious scope of the present study also im-
plicates limitations. Specifically, a thorough and ex-
haustive analysis and discussion of each sociologi-
cal paradigm and all strategy theories is unmanage-
able in a limited space and goes beyond the objec-
tives of this paper. Given the need to condense the
analysis, the paradigmatic representation is not un-
equivocal, can be overly simplistic and may neglect
relevant differences between different schools within
the meta-paradigms. This limitation may diminish
the importance of or exclude pertinent approaches.
For instance, the systemic and processual-oriented
chaos theory (Levy 1994; Stacey 1995) and the mi-
crofoundations stream (Abell et al. 2008; Felin et al.
2015) offer distinctive premises and explicit, consis-
tent and articulated ‘core logics’ (Lengnick-Hall and
Wolff 1999, p. 1110). Likewise, other approaches,
such as the ‘pragmatist’ stakeholder theory (Freeman
1984), game theory and social capital theory, may de-
serve a more detailed analysis. Presumably, there are
also some limitations to our classification of scholars
into theories, schools and paradigms. These classifi-
cations are influenced by the authors’ interpretations,
preferences and (lack of) knowledge and skills. We
hope that the paper will encourage a debate that is
not limited to scholars who may be (or feel) inappro-
priately classified.

Appendix

The above-listed theories coincide with the theo-
ries pointed out by previous review studies as the
most relevant in strategic management (Furrer et al.
2008; Kenworthy and Verbeke 2015; Nerur et al.
2008; Ramos-Rodríguez and Ruíz-Navarro 2004).
However, understanding the manner in which re-
searchers construct the ‘world of strategy’ based on
the different assumptions that they attach to their
strategic realities (Rasche 2008, p. 3) is a neces-
sary step in the identification of paradigms. Ac-
cordingly, Table 3 summarizes the basic assump-
tions included in the ‘Kuhnian’ model problem of
the above-identified approaches to strategy (Tables
A2 and A3 in the Appendix offer an in-depth look at
the basic assumptions that underlie the endogenous
approaches).
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